

**MEMORANDUM**

**TO:** All Campuses and Departments

**FROM:** Emily Garza, Director of Purchasing

**SUBJECT: COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**

The Board of Education on August 26, 2019 awarded Commercial Kitchen and Small Appliances, Equipment, Services and Supplies Catalog Bid for the 2019-2020 school year. The bid was awarded to the following vendors:

**1<sup>st</sup> Choice Restaurant Equipment and Supply, LLC**  
**Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp.**  
**Bakery Engineering Services**  
**BHS Foodservice Solutions, LLC**  
**Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, Inc.)**  
**Heritage Food Service Group, Inc.**

**IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc.**  
**Johnstone Supply**  
**Parts Town, LLC**  
**Pasco Brokerage, Inc.**  
**RMZ Kleaning Zolutions LLC**  
**United Refrigeration Inc.**

The following criteria may be used when purchasing from the awarded vendors mentioned above:

- All school campuses will receive a company catalog.
- All commercial kitchen and small appliances, equipment, services and supplies purchases are to be made solely from the awarded vendors mentioned above.

Please review tabulation for contact name, address, telephone numbers and discount (%) offered.

If you have any questions on the approved vendors listed above, please feel free to contact me at (956) 354-2000.

Sincerely,

*Emily Garza*

Director of Purchasing

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**  
**BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.**

<b>Event Number</b>	19-20-005 Addendum 1	<b>Organization</b>	PSJA ISD Ebids
<b>Event Title</b>	Commercial Kitchen and Small Appliances, Equipment, Services and Supplies Catalog Bid	<b>Workgroup</b>	Purchasing
<b>Event Description</b>		<b>Event Owner</b>	Emily Garza
<b>Event Type</b>	Catalog Bid	<b>Email</b>	<a href="mailto:emily.garza@psjaisd.us">emily.garza@psjaisd.us</a>
<b>Issue Date</b>	5/13/2019 05:02:06 PM (CT)	<b>Phone</b>	
<b>Close Date</b>	5/30/2019 04:30:00 PM (CT)	<b>Fax</b>	

Responding Supplier	City	State	Response Submitted	Lines Responded	Response Total
1st Choice Restaurant Equipment & Supply, LLC	San Antonio	TX	5/30/2019 08:34:57 AM (CT)	10	\$86,333.66
Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp	Alamo	TX	5/30/2019 03:29:06 PM (CT)	0	\$0.00
BAKERY ENGINEERING SERVICES (GERALD P DOWNEY)	OKLAHOMA CITY	OK	5/29/2019 04:36:04 PM (CT)	0	\$0.00
BHS Foodservice Solutions, LLC	Amherst	NY	5/30/2019 02:17:41 PM (CT)	8	\$65,476.75
Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, Inc.)	San Antonio	TX	5/23/2019 03:16:01 PM (CT)	0	\$0.00
Heritage Food Service Group, Inc	FORT WAYNE	IN	5/16/2019 10:18:49 AM (CT)	10	\$0.00
IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc	Pharr	TX	5/16/2019 11:20:06 AM (CT)	0	\$0.00
johnstone supply	PHARR	TX	5/23/2019 08:39:34 AM (CT)	2	\$11,445.00
Parts Town, LLC	Addison	IL	5/26/2019 08:32:55 PM (CT)	0	\$0.00
Pasco Brokerage, Inc.	Plano	TX	5/20/2019 12:12:13 PM (CT)	9	\$114,395.00
Rmz Kleaning Zolutions LLC (Jesus Ramirez)	Mission	TX	5/22/2019 05:17:36 PM (CT)	0	\$0.00
United Refrigeration Inc	Houston	TX	5/30/2019 02:12:33 PM (CT)	1	\$0.00

**Please note: Lines Responded and Response Total only includes responses to specification. No alternate response data is included.**

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.  
COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005  
BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.

Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	QTY	UOM	1st Choice Restaurant Equipment & Supply, LLC		Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp		BAKERY ENGINEERING SERVICES (GERALD P DOWNEY)		BHS Foodservice Solutions, LLC		Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, Inc.)	
						Total Price	\$86,333.66	Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$65,476.75	Total Price	\$0.00
						Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Refrigerator. Supplier Notes:	True	T-49	1	EA	\$5,579.54	\$5,579.54	No Bid				\$3,634.95	\$3,634.95	No Bid	
2	Brasing / Tilting Skillet. Supplier Notes:	Legion	CSG41-9	1	EA	\$18,410.35	\$18,410.35	No Bid				\$16,038.15	\$16,038.15	No Bid	
3	Chiller (chilled water) Supplier Notes:	Daikin	AGZ080ED5EPVH00	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid	
4	Food Warmer. Supplier Notes:		UHSI-10	1	EA	\$5,137.03	\$5,137.03	No Bid				\$4,234.94	\$4,234.94	No Bid	
5	Ice Machine. 5 ALT1 Maniwoc IYF0600-A Ice Machine Supplier Notes:	Manitowoc	IY0606A-26	1	EA	\$6,780.62	\$6,780.62	No Bid				\$4,813.13	\$4,813.13	No Bid	
		Manitowoc	IYF0600-A	1	EA										Price includes bin
6	Kettle. Supplier Notes:	Groen	INA/2-150	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid				No Bid		No Bid	
7	Mixer. Supplier Notes:	Hobart	HCM450-61-4	1	EA	\$18,164.60	\$18,164.60	No Bid				\$15,885.95	\$15,885.95	No Bid	Model #HCM450-66
8	Oven. Supplier Notes:	Vulcan	VC4ED-9	1	EA	\$7,559.62	\$7,559.62	No Bid				\$3,199.50	\$3,199.50	No Bid	Model #VC4ED
9	Steamer. Supplier Notes:	Vulcan	C24E05-1	1	EA	\$9,138.03	\$9,138.03	No Bid				\$4,789.78	\$4,789.78	No Bid	Model #C24EA3 PLUS
10	Warmer Pass Through. Supplier Notes:	Traulsen	RHF232WP	1	EA	\$15,563.87	\$15,563.87	No Bid				\$12,880.35	\$12,880.35	No Bid	

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**  
**BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.**

Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	QTY	UOM	Heritage Food Service Group, Inc		IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc		johnstone supply		Parts Town, LLC		Pasco Brokerage, Inc.	
						Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$11,445.00	Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$114,395.00
						Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Refrigerator. Supplier Notes:	True	T-49	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		\$5,495.00	\$5,495.00	No Bid		\$4,000.00	\$4,000.00
						replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.								Dock delivered (any special delivery requirements, lift gate , inside delivery, etc. are additional).	
2	Brasing / Tilting Skillet. Supplier Notes:	Legion	CSG41-9	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$15,150.00	\$15,150.00
						replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.								Question asked on gas type and answer was that this is electrical. Using this model number this item is definitely gas. Please advise if there is another item we should be looking at. No accessories included. Dock delivered (any special delivery requirements, lift gate , inside delivery, etc. are additional).	
3	Chiller (chilled water) Supplier Notes:	Daikin	AGZ080ED5EPVH00	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
						replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.									
4	Food Warmer. Supplier Notes:		UHSI-10	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$4,275.00	\$4,275.00
						replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.								FWE UHS-10	
5	Ice Machine. Supplier Notes:	Manitowoc	IY0606A-26	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		\$5,950.00	\$5,950.00	No Bid		\$3,625.00	\$3,625.00
5 ALT1	Manitowoc IYF0600-A Ice Machine Supplier Notes:	Manitowoc	IYF0600-A	1	EA	replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.								Manitowok IDT0750A	
6	Kettle. Supplier Notes:	Groen	INA/2-150	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$47,400.00	\$47,400.00
						replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.								Manufacturer # should read DEE/4T-40C1WA/2No accessories included. Dock delivered (any special delivery requirements, lift gate , inside delivery, etc. are additional).	
7	Mixer. Supplier Notes:	Hobart	HCM450-61-4	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$14,900.00	\$14,900.00
						replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.								No accessories included. Dock delivered (any special delivery requirements, lift gate , inside delivery, etc. are additional).	
8	Oven. Supplier Notes:	Vulcan	VC4ED-9	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$4,175.00	\$4,175.00
						replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.								No accessories included. Dock delivered (any special delivery requirements, lift gate , inside delivery, etc. are additional).	
9	Steamer. Supplier Notes:	Vulcan	C24E05-1	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		\$7,705.00	\$7,705.00
						replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.								No accessories included. Dock delivered (any special delivery requirements, lift gate , inside delivery, etc. are additional).	
10	Warmer Pass Through. Supplier Notes:	Traulsen	RHF232WP	1	EA	\$0.00	\$0.00	No Bid				No Bid		\$13,165.00	\$13,165.00
						replacement parts discounted at 0-35%. See attached discounted line list.								No accessories included. Dock delivered (any special delivery requirements, lift gate , inside delivery, etc. are additional).	

PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.  
 COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005  
 BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.

Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	QTY	UOM	Rmz Kleaning Zolutions LLC (Jesus Ramirez)		United Refrigeration Inc	
						Total Price	\$0.00	Total Price	\$0.00
						Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Refrigerator. Supplier Notes:	True	T-49	1	EA			No Bid	
2	Brasing / Tilting Skillet. Supplier Notes:	Legion	CSG41-9	1	EA			No Bid	
3	Chiller (chilled water) Supplier Notes:	Daikin	AGZ080ED5EPVH00	1	EA			No Bid	
4	Food Warmer. Supplier Notes:		UHSI-10	1	EA			No Bid	
5	Ice Machine. Supplier Notes:	Manitowoc	IY0606A-26	1	EA			\$3,797.52	
5 ALT1	Manitowoc IYF0600-A Ice Machine Supplier Notes:	Manitowoc	IYF0600-A	1	EA				
6	Kettle. Supplier Notes:	Groen	INA/2-150	1	EA			No Bid	
7	Mixer. Supplier Notes:	Hobart	HCM450-61-4	1	EA			No Bid	
8	Oven. Supplier Notes:	Vulcan	VC4ED-9	1	EA			No Bid	
9	Steamer. Supplier Notes:	Vulcan	C24E05-1	1	EA			No Bid	
10	Warmer Pass Through. Supplier Notes:	Traulsen	RHF232WP	1	EA			No Bid	

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**  
**BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.**

Att #	Attribute Name	1st Choice Restaurant Equipment & Supply, LLC	Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp	BAKERY ENGINEERING SERVICES (GERALD P DOWNEY)	BHS Foodservice Solutions, LLC
58	Discount off price to the Pharr-San Juan-Alamo Independent School District shall be:				
59	Off Shelf Price	1%	0%	0%	0%
60	Off Catalog Price (MFG. Suggested List Price)	1%	0%	10%	0%
61	Cost Plus		0%	0%	0%
62	Unit / Quantity / Volume Discount Shelf Price / Store	No	No	No	No
63	Does discount off shelfprice apply to all items in store?	Yes	No	Yes	No
64	If Other, please state:	see attached			Discount per manufacturer, please see attached document 'Discount Off List'
65	Catalog Price Does catalog price apply to all items catalog? If Other, please state:	Yes	No	Yes	Other
66		see attached			Discount per manufacturer, please see attached document 'Discount Off List'
67	Cost Plus Does cost plus pricing apply to all items?	NR	No	Other	Other
68	If Other, please state:			NA	Discount per manufacturer, please see attached document 'Discount Off List'
69	What month and year is your current catalog published? (If applicable)	1/1/2019	NR	NR	NR
70	Are your shelf prices guaranteed from September 1, 2019 through August 31, 2020?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
71	Are your catalogs guaranteed through August 31, 2020, with discounts to be taken from your printed (2019) catalog price?	Yes	Yes	Yes	No
72	Sales Representative information.				
73	Representative Name Please provide Name of Representative.	Robert Jones	Eleazar Pena	PAUL DOWNEY	Mckenzie Marvel
74	Representative Location Please provide the location (city and state) of representative.	San Antonio, TX	1432 N Alamo Rd. Alamo, TX 78516	OKLAHOMA CITY OK	Phoenix, AZ
75	Representative Telephone Number	(210) 595-3131	(956) 702-8700	(405) 949-9459	(360) 463-3731
76	Representative Cellular Number	(210) 246-2923	(956) 827-1731	(405) 623-1820	NR
77	Representative Fax Number	(210) 892-0335	(956) 702-8704	(405) 949-9469	NR
78	Representative Email Address	orders@1stchoiceres.com	service@aircooltechcorp.com	bakeng@sbcglobal.net	mmarvel@bhsfoodservicesolutions.com
79	What is the e-mail address for all Purchase Orders to be sent to?	orders@1stchoiceres.com	service@aircooltechcorp.com	bakeng@sbcglobal.net	mmarvel@bhsfoodservicesolutions.com
80	Is there a minimum dollar / quantity / volume purchase amount required for delivery?	No	Yes	No	No
81	Does your company charge packing and handling?	No	No	No	Yes
82	If yes, how much? and explain.				Per manufacturer

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**  
**BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.**

Att #	Attribute Name	1st Choice Restaurant Equipment & Supply, LLC	Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp	BAKERY ENGINEERING SERVICES (GERALD P DOWNEY)	BHS Foodservice Solutions, LLC
83	Partial deliveries of purchase orders are not accepted by Pharr-San Juan-Alamo I.S.D. only complete orders are accepted. Can you comply with this?	Yes	Yes	Yes	No
84	What would be the delivery time once a purchase order is received? Please provide number of days.	Varies per order	1-3 business days	15-30 days based on supplier's lead time	30 Days ARO - depending on manufacturer
85	Does your company charge a restocking fee on returned merchandise / warehouse stock?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
86	If yes, how much?	10% plus freight	5%	based on manufacturer's restocking fee, if any	Various per manufacturer
87	Your bid must be F.O.B. Pharr, Texas 78577. The discount above is F.O.B. Pharr with a minimum delivered to one location. Please state minimum order if any.	n/a	\$250.00	NR	Per manufacturer if installation is required
88	Can you deliver to all locations district wide?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
89	If providing service (labor) only or service (labor) and parts, Please fill out the following information:				
90	Hourly Labor Charge - Straight Time		Per Hour	other (list description)	
91	If other, list description	NR	\$85.00	per day	NR
92	Hourly Labor Charge - Overtime. including after 5:00 p.m., Weekends and Holidays		Per Hour	other (list description)	
93	If other, list description	NR	\$127.50	per day	NR
94	Hourly Labor Charge - Extra Man - Straight Time		Per Hour	other (list description)	
95	If other, list description	NR	\$65.00	NA	NR
96	Hourly Labor Charge - Extra Man - Overtime including after 5:00 p.m., Weekends and Holidays		Per Hour	other (list description)	
97	If other, list description	NR	\$97.50	NA	NR
98	Materials are charged: (select one)		Marked up by (cost plus)	At Cost	
99	Please state amount of charge for the selection from the previous question.	NR	\$1.00 to \$100 at 50% / \$100 - \$500 at 35% / \$500 to \$1000 at 25%	Materials purchased locally for repairs are charged at cost.	NR
100	If other, please explain.				

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**  
**BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.**

Att #	Attribute Name	Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, Inc.)	Heritage Food Service Group, Inc	IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc	johnstone supply
58	Discount off price to the Pharr-San Juan-Alamo Independent School District shall be:				
59	Off Shelf Price	25%	0%	10%	0%
60	Off Catalog Price (MFG. Suggested List Price)	0%	0%	10%	50%
61	Cost Plus	50%	0%	35%	0%
62	Unit / Quantity / Volume Discount Shelf Price / Store	No	No	Yes	Yes
63	Does discount off shelfprice apply to all items in store?	Yes	Other	No	Yes
64	If Other, please state:	Discount ranges from 0-30% depending on manufacturer. This is for parts purchased over the counter only. We don't do cost plus pricing.	See Attached discounted manufacturer list		
65	Catalog Price Does catalog price apply to all items catalog?	Other	Other	Yes	Yes
66	If Other, please state:	Catalog is not available, can provide excel price sheet per manufacturer, if desired.	See Attached discounted manufacturer list		
67	Cost Plus Does cost plus pricing apply to all items?	No	Other	Yes	Yes
68	If Other, please state:	We do not do cost plus pricing.	See Attached discounted manufacturer list		N/A
69	What month and year is your current catalog published? (If applicable)	NR	NR		4/1/2019
70	Are your shelf prices guaranteed from September 1, 2019 through August 31, 2020?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
71	Are your catalogs guaranteed through August 31, 2020, with discounts to be taken from your printed (2019) catalog price?	No	NR	Yes	Yes
72	Sales Representative information.				
73	Representative Name Please provide Name of Representative.	Bill Leader or Martin Martinez	Tari Kovets	Donato Vera	RICK GARCIA
74	Representative Location Please provide the location (city and state) of representative.	San Antonio, Texas or McAllen, Texas	Fort Wayne, IN	5100 N. Cage Blvd, Pharr, TX 78577	PHARR , TX
75	Representative Telephone Number	(210) 735-2811	(800) 458-5593	(956) 783-7646	(956) 783-1036
76	Representative Cellular Number	(210) 559-3053	(800) 458-5593	(956) 330-6193	(956) 533-5470
77	Representative Fax Number	(210) 735-7421	(800) 800-4981		(956) 783-5106
78	Representative Email Address	martin@commercialkitchen.com	ContractServices@hfse.com	info@iforklift.net	RICK.GARCIA@JOHNSTONESUPPLY.COM
79	What is the e-mail address for all Purchase Orders to be sent to?	martin@commercialkitchen.com	ContractServices@hfse.com	info@iforkift.net	RICK.GARCIA@JOHNSTONESUPPLY.COM
80	Is there a minimum dollar / quantity / volume purchase amount required for delivery?	No	No	No	No
81	Does your company charge packing and handling?	No	No	No	No
82	If yes, how much? and explain.	NR	Exception if item requires special packaging	NR	0



**PHARR -SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**  
**BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.**

Att #	Attribute Name	Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, Inc.)	Heritage Food Service Group, Inc	IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc	johnstone supply
83	Partial deliveries of purchase orders are not accepted by Pharr-San Juan-Alamo I.S.D. only complete orders are accepted. Can you comply with this?	Yes	No	Yes	Yes
84	What would be the delivery time once a purchase order is received? Please provide number of days.	2 to 10 business day, depending on how part is ordered. Example: NDA, 3 day or regular (7 to 10 days).	3-5 days for in stock items	2	1-2 DAYS
85	Does your company charge a restocking fee on returned merchandise / warehouse stock?	Yes	Yes	Yes	No
86	If yes, how much?	25%	Dependant on time - see warranty/returns policy. Subject to change - we will work with buyer	25%	0
87	Your bid must be F.O.B. Pharr, Texas 78577. The discount above is F.O.B. Pharr with a minimum delivered to one location. Please state minimum order if any.	n/a	0	NR	0
88	Can you deliver to all locations district wide?	Yes	Yes	Yes	Yes
89	If providing service (labor) only or service (labor) and parts, Please fill out the following information:				
90	Hourly Labor Charge - Straight Time	Per Hour		Per Hour	other (list description)
91	If other, list description	\$104 plus service fee of \$115. If multiple pieces of equipment are repaired at the same time at the same location, only one service fee is billed.	NR	NR	0
92	Hourly Labor Charge - Overtime. including after 5:00 p.m., Weekends and Holidays	Per Hour		Per Hour	other (list description)
93	If other, list description	\$156 plus service fee of \$115. If multiple pieces of equipment are repaired at the same time at the same location, only one service fee is billed.	NR	NR	United States
94	Hourly Labor Charge - Extra Man - Straight Time	Per Hour		Per Hour	other (list description)
95	If other, list description	\$52.00	NR	NR	HIDALGO
96	Hourly Labor Charge - Extra Man - Overtime including after 5:00 p.m., Weekends and Holidays	Per Hour		Per Hour	other (list description)
97	If other, list description	\$78.00	NR		Texas
98	Materials are charged: (select one)	Other, please explain		Marked up by (cost plus)	Other, please explain
99	Please state amount of charge for the selection from the previous question.	Parts installed for repairs are billed at manufacturer suggested list price plus freight (freight at cost, no mark up).	NR	35%	0
100	If other, please explain.	Note: no catalog is available, shelf pricing only. Discount for over the counter parts sales is 0-30% depending on the manufacturer.			WE ARE JUST A SUPPLY HOUSE..WE DONT DO SERVICE.

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**  
**BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.**

Att #	Attribute Name	Parts Town, LLC	Pasco Brokerage, Inc.	Rmz Kleaning Zolutions LLC (Jesus Ramirez)	United Refrigeration Inc
58	Discount off price to the Pharr-San Juan-Alamo Independent School District shall be:				
59	Off Shelf Price	0%	5%	NR	50%
60	Off Catalog Price (MFG. Suggested List Price)	0%	NR	NR	50%
61	Cost Plus		NR	NR	NR
62	Unit / Quantity / Volume Discount Shelf Price / Store	No	NR	NR	NR
63	Does discount off shelfprice apply to all items in store?	No	NR	NR	NR
64	If Other, please state:			n/a	
65	Catalog Price Does catalog price apply to all items catalog?	Other	NR	NR	NR
66	If Other, please state:	Discounts are a percentage (%) off list price by manufacturer. The only exception to this is when a manufacturer is offering a short discount to Parts Town. Any short discounts will be listed at the request of a quote and/or at time of purchase.		n/a	
67	Cost Plus Does cost plus pricing apply to all items?	No	NR	NR	NR
68	If Other, please state:			n/a	
69	What month and year is your current catalog published? (If applicable)	NR	NR	NR	NR
70	Are your shelf prices guaranteed from September 1, 2019 through August 31, 2020?	No	NR	NR	NR
71	Are your catalogs guaranteed through August 31, 2020, with discounts to be taken from your printed (2019) catalog price?	No	NR	NR	NR
72	Sales Representative information.				
73	Representative Name Please provide Name of Representative.	Elesio De Rango	Kasey Hollon	Jesus A Ramirez III	Kenneth Broz
74	Representative Location Please provide the location (city and state) of representative.	Addison, IL	Plano, TX	Mission texas	Houston, TX
75	Representative Telephone Number	(630) 403-9228	972-596-3350	(956) 598-4265	713-864-6171
76	Representative Cellular Number		214-564-3929	(956) 598-4265	713-825-4041
77	Representative Fax Number	(888) 513-0259	972-596-2817	NR	713-864-2720
78	Representative Email Address	ederango@partstown.com	<a href="mailto:khollon@pascoinc.net">khollon@pascoinc.net</a>	kleaningzolutions@gmail.com	<a href="mailto:kbroz@uri.com">kbroz@uri.com</a>
79	What is the e-mail address for all Purchase Orders to be sent to?	iserve@partstown.com	<a href="mailto:orders@pascoinc.net">orders@pascoinc.net</a>	kleaningzolutions@gmail.com	<a href="mailto:kbroz@uri.com">kbroz@uri.com</a>
80	Is there a minimum dollar / quantity / volume purchase amount required for delivery?	No	NR	No	NR
81	Does your company charge packing and handling?	Yes	NR	Yes	NR
82	If yes, how much? and explain.	Packaging and handling fees may apply for large freight, hazardous materials, special handling or expedited shipping requests.		\$20 minimum on orders.	

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**  
**BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.**

Att #	Attribute Name	Parts Town, LLC	Pasco Brokerage, Inc.	Rmz Kleaning Zolutions LLC (Jesus Ramirez)	United Refrigeration Inc
83	Partial deliveries of purchase orders are not accepted by Pharr-San Juan-Alamo I.S.D. only complete orders are accepted. Can you comply with this?	Yes	NR	Yes	NR
84	What would be the delivery time once a purchase order is received? Please provide number of days.	All in stock inventory will be delivered in 1 to 3 days. Lead time will be provided for any back-ordered items.		3-5 business days	
85	Does your company charge a restocking fee on returned merchandise / warehouse stock?	Yes	NR	Yes	NR
86	If yes, how much?	There is no restocking fee for anything returned up to 120 days of invoice date. Orders 120 days past the invoice date are subject to a 25% restocking charge.		20% of unit price	
87	Your bid must be F.O.B. Pharr, Texas 78577. The discount above is F.O.B. Pharr with a minimum delivered to one location. Please state minimum order if any.	No minimum	NR	NR	NR
88	Can you deliver to all locations district wide?	Yes		Yes	
89	If providing service (labor) only or service (labor) and parts, Please fill out the following information:	NR	NR		NR
90	Hourly Labor Charge - Straight Time	other (list description)		Per Hour	
91	If other, list description	NR	NR	85hr	NR
92	Hourly Labor Charge - Overtime. including after 5:00 p.m., Weekends and Holidays			Per Hour	
93	If other, list description	NR	NR	150hr	NR
94	Hourly Labor Charge - Extra Man - Straight Time			Per Hour	
95	If other, list description	NR	NR	55hr	NR
96	Hourly Labor Charge - Extra Man - Overtime including after 5:00 p.m., Weekends and Holidays			Per Hour	
97	If other, list description	NR	NR	85hr	NR
98	Materials are charged: (select one)			At Cost	
99	Please state amount of charge for the selection from the previous question.	NR	NR	n/a	NR
100	If other, please explain.			n/a	

**PHARR - SAN JUAN - ALAMO I.S.D.**  
**COMMERCIAL KITCHEN AND SMALL APPLIANCES, EQUIPMENT, SERVICES AND SUPPLIES CATALOG BID # 19-20-005**  
**BID OPENING: MAY 30, 2019 @ 4:30 P.M.**

<b>Responding Supplier</b>	<b>Signature Full Name</b>	<b>Signature Email</b>	<b>Supplier Notes</b>
BAKERY ENGINEERING SERVICES (GERALD P DOWNEY)	LINDA SUGGS	bakeng@sbcglobal.net	
IFI Industrial Forklift, Inc	Donato Vera	info@iforklift.net	I did not find the section to upload the insurance card that you requested, if you can tell me where can I upload it or e-mail to send it.
			Thanks
United Refrigeration Inc	KENNETH BROZ	Kbroz@uri.com	
Parts Town, LLC	Bryan Thomas	bthomas@partstown.com	
Rmz Kleaning Zolutions LLC (Jesus Ramirez)	Jesus A Ramirez III	kleaningzolutions@gmail.com	We service all refrigeratiob work, kitchen equipment, hvac, exhaust hood cleaning.
Aircool Tech-ACT, Corp	Celeste Cantu	service@aircooltechcorp.com	
Heritage Food Service Group, Inc	Tari Kovets	ContractServices@hfse.com	
Commercial Kitchen Parts & Service (Greenwich, Inc.)	D'Ann Ivers	divers@commercialkitchen.com	Parts price lists are attached as well as PM rates if desired. We do not sale equipment only OEM parts and provide service for warranty and repairs.
johnstone supply	RICK GARCIA	RICK.GARCIA@JOHNSTONESUPPLY.COM	50% OFF CATALOG LIST PRICE .
BHS Foodservice Solutions, LLC	McKenzie Marvel	mmarvel@bhsfoodservicesolutions.com	
1st Choice Restaurant Equipment & Supply, LLC	Seth Rosborough	orders@1stchoiceres.com	
Pasco Brokerage, Inc.	Kasey Hollon	khollon@pascoinc.net	Items are dock delivered. Terms: Net 30 ACH or Check.